
Results: Fourteen reviewsmet inclusion criteria, comprising 16,277
cases and 77,586 controls. Psychological trauma met TRANSD
criteria as a transdiagnostic factor across diferent diagnostic criteria
and spectra. There was highly suggestive evidence of an association
between psychological trauma at any time-point and any mental
disorder (OR=2.92) and between childhood trauma and any men-
tal disorder
(OR=2.90). Regarding specifc trauma types, convincing evidence
linked physical abuse (OR=2.36) and highly suggestive evidence
linked sexual abuse (OR=3.47) with a range of mental disorders,
and convincing evidence linked emotional abuse to anxiety dis-
orders (OR=3.05); there were no data for emotional abuse with
other disorders.
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Conclusions:These fndings highlight the importance of preventing
early traumatic events and providing trauma-informed care in early
intervention and psychiatric services.
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Introduction: Studies have shown that dementia family caregivers
to be significantly more burdened than non-dementia caregivers.
Objectives: The aim of the present study was to analyze factors
affecting the quality of life and the burden of dementia family
caregivers.
Methods: 70 dementia family caregivers who lived in the Attica
Region, Greece participated in the study from February to April
2022. An anonymous questionnaire was used including 16 items
regarding demographic and socio-economic factors. The 22 -item
Zarit Burden scale was used to estimate the burden of dementia
family caregivers. Statistical analysis was performed with SPSS 21.
Results: 1.4% of caregivers showed minimal to no burden (n = 1).
28% of caregivers (n = 20) a mild to moderate burden. 40.6% (n =
29) presented a moderate to severe burden, while 28% (n = 20) a
very serious burden. According to the results of the present study,
there are three main factors that affect the quality of life of care-
givers. Caregivers who spend more time with the patient have an
increased burden compared to caregivers who spend less time. The
patient’s low Mini Mental score is associated with an increase in
burden. Caregivers who have attended training and management
programs for the care of a patient with dementia have a lower
burden than those who have not attended programs.
Conclusions: The study highlights an increased burden on care-
givers. Social supports with multiple coping strategies focusing on
different levels of patients with dementia and caregivers’ needs
should be planned to relieve the caregiver burden.
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Introduction: The spectacular progress of the last decade in the
field of genetics is allowing a new development of medicine and the
ability to make a better diagnosis. A great example of this is the
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