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A REVIEW AND EVALUATION OF METHADO:'<lEDOSE
ASSESSMENT

J.T. Bowen, L.A.Sell. Senior Registrar, The Maudsley Hospital, 4
Windsor Walk, London SE5; Clinical Lecturer; Institute of
Psychiatry, Addictions Sciences Building, 4 Windsor Walk, London
SE5

Despite the widespread need and clinical importance of methadone
dose assessment within UK addict ion services there are no empir­
ical studies to support the process or outcome of anyone method .
The main goal of assessm ent is to provide an adequate dose of
methadone in order that other treatment goals can be achieved after
stabilization. An excessive dose must be avoided in the interests of
individual safety and to minim ise the risk of diversion of methadone
on to the black market, and consequent public harm. A literature
review reveals that methods of assessment vary considerably in
their intensity of involvement of health professionals. Results of a
recent national survey of assessment methods provides a summary
of the current range of assessment methods used. An evaluation of
two different assessment protocols is discussed in terms of service
resource inputs and dependent variables such as client engagement.
client percept ions, methadone dosage changes and other potential
health gains .

RAPID OPIATE DETOXIFICATION AND NALTREXONE
INDUCTION UNDER GENERAL ANAESTHESIA AND
ASSISTED VENTILATION: EXPERIENCES WITH 265
PATIENTS IN THREE DIFFERENT CENTRES

Colin Brewer, Mary Laban, Charles Schmulian, Yiannis Kasvikis,
Lance Gooberman. The Stapleford Centre. 25a Eccleston St..
London SW1W 9NP; Athens; Merchantville, NJ

Using broadly similar techniques. we have successfully detoxified
265 patients (71 in London, 19 in Athens, 175 in Merchantville)
dependent on heroin or up to 200 mg of methadone daily and
transferred them to full doses of naltrexone (50-100 mg) under
anaesthesia with endotracheal intubat ion and assisted ventilation.
Th is is a modification of methods originally developed by Loimer et
al (1988) in Vienna and avoids the hazards of the method described
by Legard a and Gossop (1994).

Methods; For most patients. anaesthesia was induced and main­
tained (for 4-6 hours) with ilv propofol but in five cases, isoflurane
via closed circuit was used. It seems a satisfactory and more
economical alternative. Atracurium is used for muscle relaxation.
Antiemetics are given prophylactically, as is octreotide which greatly
diminishes the gastric hypersecretion and profuse diarrhoea com­
monly accomp anying the procedure.

Results: No significant anaesthetic complications occurred . Most
patients were fit to return home within 24 hours. It can often be
done as an out-patient procedure if suitable non-hospital observation
facilities are available . However. 10-15% of patient s benefit from an
extra day or two of nursing . especially if home facilities are poor.
Flexible post-detoxification care is needed to accommodate these
differences. Wh ile objective withdrawal manifestations generally di­
minish sharply within 24 hours. some patients have a more prolonged
subjective abst inence syndrome which may need vigorous medical
and psychosocial management. The technique is equally rapid and
successful for both methadone and heroin withdrawal. There was no
apparent relationship between previous heroin or methadone dose
and speed of recovery.

Conclusion ; Withdrawal and naltrexone induction under anaesthe­
sia is rapid and effective and makes detoxification a less frightening
and unattractive prospect. Cont inued treatment after withdrawal ,
preferably including supervised naltrexone, is important for most
patients.

ALCOHOL CONSUMPTION AMONG CHRONIC
MENTALLY ILL RESIDENTS OF THERAPEUTIC HOMES

Jens Bullenkamp. Burkhardt Voges. Central Institute ofMental
Health,) 5. D-68159 Mannheim, Germany

We conducted a study on alcohol consumption habits in the five
therapeutic homes for the mentally ill in Mannheim. Through as­
sessment by their case managers we collected data for 136 residents.
The medium age of the study population was 40.3 years ; 57.4 %
were male. In 80.I% of the cases of schizophrenia was diagnosed,
secondary alcohol abuse before entry into the home was known in
4.4% through admission diagnosis.

Frequent alcohol use is currently reported in 12.5%, which re­
mained consistent for most residents during the time of stay in the
home . This group of frequent alcohol users. predom inantly male. is
characterized by a higher age at entry into the institution and a lower
dosage of neuroleptic medication . No significant relation was found
regarding the age at onset of disease. the rehospitalisation rate and
the general life satisfaction. Severe problems through alcohol use
were seen only in isolated cases, but in all clients with an earlier
diagnosis of alcohol abuse. We conclude that in therapeutic homes
problematic alcohol abuse is reported less frequently than in other
comparable population s of chron ic mentally ill clients .

It appears that through selective mechan isms (house rules, admis­
sion criteria) mentally ill people with additional alcohol problems
are excluded from the care in therapeutic homes. Verification is
needed whether patients with dual diagnosis actually desire this kind
of complementary support, or possibly refuse this offer because of
the infringements of individual rights, as it is the rule in therapeutic
institutions.

PREVALENCE OF CHILDHOOD SEXUAL ABUSE IN
MALTESE SUBSTANCE ABUSERS ATTENDING SERVICES

T. Buttig ieg. • Malta, Sedqa (Agency Against Drug and Alcohol
Abuse); St. George's Hospital Medical School, Department of
Addictive Behav iour, Cranmer Terrace, London, SW17 OPz, UK

The main goal of this research is to investigate the prevalence
of childhood sexual abuse amongst substance abuse population at­
tending services in Malta. The epidemiological analysis of such
prevalence in Malta has never been studied before .

The study was conducted using an interview based on 'The Child
Maltreatment Interview Schedule' by Briere J.N. Subjects were
randomly chosen from the several drug and alcohol services on the
island.

Results show a high prevalence rate amongst this population.
which to some extent is comparable with similar data collected from
most European countries and world-wide.

Some cultural specifics are identified and defined.

SOURCES OF INFORMATION, KNOWLEDGE AND
ATTITUDES ABOUT AIDS AMONG UNIVERSITY
STUDENTS IN SPAIN

M.D. Carretero, C. Martin. P. Soler, M. Soler, A.N. Singh I,

J. Catalan I. Department of Psychiatry and Medical Psychology,
Medical School, Granada, Spain; I Charing Cross and Westminster
Medical School. Psychological Medicine Department, Chelsea and
Westminster Hospital, 369 Fulham Road, London SW10 9NH. UK

To assess sources of information, knowledge and attitudes about
AIDS. 5515 university students from 19 faculties of Granada Uni­
versity (Spain) were surveyed in 1991. A questionnaire consisting
of 40 items was administered. Seventy-seven percent of University
students did not consider themselves well informed and 87% did not
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feel there was enough infonnation. However. good general knowl­
edge about means of transmission (98% reported blood and 82%
semen) and prevention measures (78% indicated condom use) was
shown. Despite a predominant positiveattitude towards peoplewith
AIDS (68% would increase closeness), attitudes of rejection were
shown(7%said wouldhave nothing further to do witha mv+ friend
and 4% would exclude that person from work or school). Students'
responses indicated lack of knowledge and misconceptions. only
41% of students mentioned vaginal secretions as a mean of trans­
mission. In addition,30% of students thoughttheycould be infected
by sharing a toilet with an HIV+ patient, 5% by sharing dishes and
drinking glasses and, 4% by sharing a napkin. The most striking
misconceptions about preventive measures were. choice of partner
(reported by 27%) and faithfullness (reported by 22%). Television
(78%) and newspapers (49%) were the most common sources of
information about AIDS. University students mentioned doctors as
the bestpersonto infonne about AIDS.Theseresultsshouldbe taken
into account when designing AIDSrelated information programs. in
order to addressprevalent misconceptions amonguniversity students.

PSYCHOLOGICALMORBIDITY, SOCIAL
CIRCUMSTANCES, SEXUAL BEHAVIOUR ANDHIV IN
KENYAN COMMUNITY SAMPLE

A.I. Carson. R. Sandler.EN. Owino,EO.G. Matete,
E.C. Johnstone. Department of Psychiatry. The University of
Edinburgh. KennedyTower, Royal Edinburgh Hospital. Morningside
Park, EdinburghEH10 5HF

Objectives:To study social factors. sexualbehaviourand psychiatric
morbidity associated with mv in a community sample of working
adults in WesternKenya.

Design: Cross-sectional cohort study with subjects and raters
blind to HIV status.

Selling: An occupational health clinic for statutoryannual health
checks of workersin the food industry.

Subjects: Workingadults who attended the clinic over a 10 week
period beginning in September 1994.

Main outcome measures: mv serostatus tested by ELISA. Psy­
chiatric and neuropsychological morbidity.

Results: 40% of those tested were mv positive. Women had a
higher rate than men and those who worked as barmaids or were
divorced, widowedor separated were particularly at risk. There was
almost universal understanding of mv transmission but unrealisti­
cally low perceptionof personal risk of infection. Mostof the cohort
were living in conditions of overcrowding with poor sanitation,
predisposingthem to infectiousdisease in the eventof compromised
immunity. Though the 92 mv positive subjects had a total of 200
current sexual partners,only 6 were regularcondomusers.They bad
a total of 481 dependents. There was no difference in psychiatric
morbidityor neuropsychological function betweenthe mv positive
and the mv negative subjects.

Conclusions:Though there wasa goodunderstanding of howHIV
is transmitted. there had been little appropriate behaviour change
to reduce risk of infection. The large number of dependents of
currently economically active HIV positive individuals suggeststhe
likelihood of major social problems in the future. Asymptomatic
HIV infection is not associated with an increase in psychiatric or
neuropsychological morbidity.

LE JEU DRAMATIQUE EN PEDOPSYCHIATRIE: TRAVAIL
SUR VACCESA LA TRANSITIONNALITE

E Chaine.S. Fournier.C. Epelbaurn, P.Ferrari. Fondation Valtee. 7
rue Benserade, 94250Gentilly. France

Therapeutes travaillant dans un centre de consultation de Psychiatrie
infante-juvenile de la banlieue de Paris. les auteurs proposent une
presentation theorique et clinique, 11 propos d'un groupe therapeu­
tique de Jeu Dramatique bebdomadaire reunissant une dizaine de
preadolescents de 10 11 1280S.

Ces jeunes patients, presentant un ensemble de troubles du
comportement -avec leur retentissement scolaire et social-ont tous
experimente de multiples prises en charge psychologiques dont les
resultats sont restes aleatoires. Leurs carences narcissiques, leurs
tendances 11 I'agir, ainsi que la pauvretede leurjeu fantasmatique les
confrontent11 des representations crues ou 11 un vecu de vide interne,
qu'ils cherchentparfois11 comblerpar une dependanceaudiovisuelle
ou l' accrochage 11 des groupesde jeunes.

Le leu Dramatique a, dans ces cas, pour objectif principal la
restauration d'une capacite it jouer et 11 imaginer, dans un climat de
holding 11 la fois pare- excitant et stimulant. En creant un cadre tres
structure et en permettant un etayage sur Ie groupe, il procure un
contenant propice 11 la mise en scene des fantasmes. II en decoule
une meilleureutilisation de I'aire transitionnelle.

Souvent propose 11 cet Age charniere entre I'enfance et I'adoles­
cence, ce type de prise en charge pennet egalemen; de garder avec
ces jeunes tres perturbes,des lien, preparant l'eventualite d'un suivi
ulterleurplus individualise.

OUR EXPERIENCEIN URGENTPSYCHIATRIC
CONSULTATIONS IN A GENERALHOSPITALCENTER

P.Christova.J.P.Moulin,O. Bais, B. Riviere. Departamentof
Psychiatry. GeneralHospital Center Le Fontenoy; 28630 Le
Coudray; France; Departamentof Urgences, General Hospital
Center Le Fontenoy. 28630 Le Coudray; France

Task: Investigation of the most common psychiatric pathologies in
providingpsychiatric consultations (Urgencesand Liaison Psychia­
try) in General Hospital Center "Le Fontenoy", Chartres. This aims
improvement of the therapeutic strategies later (in short and long
term).

Method: Diagnosisare decided according to criteria of lCD-tO.
Results: In a period of one month. chosen occasionally, we have

consulted 186 men. 150 of them were urgently hospitalised in Ur­
gences and the rest 36 were hospitalised becauseof non-psychiatric
reasons in the somaticdepartarnents of the hospital.For 127 men the
main syndromein the clinic table is the depressive one and 88 who
were consulted in the Urgences had tried to commit suicide/most
often medicamental}. The depressively ill from the latter group are
primarilyyoung women,experiencing critical circumstances.

Perspectives: The specifity of the most common symptomasy
leads us to the notion of changing the therapeutic strategy toward
those patients through a quick diagnosis decision. urgent crisis
interventions and adequateorientation.

THE EXPERIENCESOF WITHDRAWAL ANDCRAVING IN
ALCOHOLANDOPIATEDEPENDENCE

lB. Crome.DepartmentofPsychiatry. Keele University.
Stoke-on-Trent, ST4 7QB. UK

While observational studies have confirmed the existence of the
withdrawal state. there has been much debate regardingthe concept
of craving. A literature review demonstrated the inadequacy and
inconsistency of the instruments utilised for measuring withdrawal
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