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Abstract
The aim of this study was to examine the associations of dietary-lifestyle patterns (DLPs) with adiposity and metabolic abnormalities
in young Polish men. The cross-sectional study included 367 men 19–40-year-old. Dietary and lifestyle behaviours were determined
with food frequency questionnaire (Jezewska-Zychowicz et al. 2018, http://www.knozc.pan.pl). DPLs were derived with Principal
Component Analysis. Body size and composition was assessed using measuring tapes and bioelectrical impedance analysis (BIA)
method. Adiposity was determined by the assessment of excessive body weight (body mass index, BMI = 25–29.9kg/m2 for overweight
and≥ 30kg/m2 for obesity), body-fat content (percentage body fat, %BF> 25%), central obesity status (waist circumference, WC>
102cm) and skeletal muscle mass (SMM< 31kg/m2). Metabolic abnormalities were determined if parameters exceeded: 100mg/dL for
fasting blood glucose (FBG), 150mg/dL for triglycerides (TG), 200mg/dL for total cholesterol (TC) and at least one component of
blood pressure (BP) was above the norm (SBP≥ 130mmHg or/and DBP≥ 80mmHg). Multivariate logistic regression was used to cal-
culate odds ratio (OR) and verify the association between variables. Four DLPs were derived, explaining 33% of the variance. Greater
adherence (upper vs. bottom tertile) to “Protein food, fried-food and recreational physical activity” (DLP1) and “Healthy diet, activ-
ity at work, former smoking” (DLP4) patterns was associated with higher odds of being overweight (odds ratio, OR= 2.12, 95% confi-
dence interval, 95%CI: 1.15–3.89; 3.05,1.69–5.53) but with high SMM (2.62, 1.53–4.49; 3.27, 1.91–5.59) and lower odds of central
obesity (0.36, 0.16–0.83; 0.30, 0.12–0.74) and high body-fat content (0.22, 0.11–0.43; 0.37, 0.19–0.72). In addition, men from the
upper tertile of DLP1 had lower odds of increased TC (0.43, 0.24–0.75). Greater adherence to “Sandwiches and convenience
foods” pattern (DPL2) was associated with higher odds of central obesity (3.36,1.38–8.12), high body-fat content (3.69, 1.88–7.24)
and high TC (2.50, 1.47–4.59) and lower odds of high SMM (0.54,0.32–0.90). Greater adherence to “Fast foods and stimulants” pat-
tern (DLP3) was associated with higher odds of general and central obesity (2.56,1.00–6.56; 3.54, 1.53–8.19), high body-fat content
(4.47, 2.05–9.73), but not with metabolic abnormalities. No associations between upper tertiles of DLPs and FBG, TG and BP were
found. The clustering of dietary and lifestyle behaviours in men revealed that healthy diet attempts combined with active lifestyle, at
work or leisure time, reduced risk of adiposity and metabolic abnormalities, despite some unhealthy components, former smoking or
fried-food consumption. The study strengthens previous findings that unhealthy dietary behaviours have an adverse effect on adipos-
ity outcomes and metabolic health, potentially through the mechanisms associated with central obesity.
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