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Background

Across the United Kingdom (UK) over the past
15 years, service and research networks in urgent
health care have grown in parallel. For urgent
health care services there has been a steady and
sustained expansion in the range of services avail-
able since the numerical restriction on General
Practice (GP) Out-of-Hours was lifted in 1994.
Beginning with the advent of GP Cooperatives, this
has continued with the increased involvement of
other health professionals in urgent care, especially
out of hours, and the development of new roles and
ways of working. The provision of primary care
treatment centres has extended this trend. This
arguably reflects a policy shift in primary health
care towards the centralisation of service strategy
and provision as sites variously referred to as
‘treatment centres’, ‘urgent care centres’ and ‘pri-
mary care emergency centres’ are deliberately
designed to complement centrally promoted NHS
walk-in centres and minor injuries units.

At the same time, the scope of the research in
urgent-access primary care has grown from its
original narrow focus on the effectiveness of
medical services to include a much broader spec-
trum of professional contributions and knowledge,
and a stronger focus on the experiences and
preferences of service users. This research now
covers, for example, management studies, nurse-
led assessments, operational modelling and health
economists’ evaluations (eg, Lattimer et al., 2000;

Brailsford et al., 2004; Gerard et al., 2004; Scott
et al., 2004). For both urgent health care service
and research developments, accordingly, the basic
networking tenet for extended primary health
care has applied: organised horizontal activity is
more effective than hierarchic approaches when
the issues to be addressed are complex and the
delivery systems fragmented (Warner and Gould,
2007).

The parallel development of service and
research networks in urgent health care has not
been interdependent, but has been mutually
supportive. Indeed, on both fronts it has raised
the status of urgent health care to that of a single
specialist subject. On the one hand, night-time
calls, patient transport, accidents, minor casualty
referrals, on-line contacts and emergencies have
all been brought together as the object of a
discrete commissioning function in the majority
of NHS Primary Care Trusts in England, in
which there is a new emphasis on prevention and
systems-wide perspectives. On the other hand,
urgent health care research has moved from
being the domain of a few interested individual
General Medical Practitioner (GMP) researchers
to be the target of multi-disciplinary tenders
that no longer depend on a single source but draw
on expertise from across a series of academic
sites. Recognising that patients receive their care
through the wider NHS workforce, the Centre
for Service Delivery and Organisation (SDO)
research programme on workforce issues is fund-
ing twelve studies, with most involving partner-
ships between different universities. These are
addressing aspects of the organisation, recruit-
ment, retention, training and development needs
of the NHS workforce.
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Current developments

One of these studies is being undertaken by a
research network connecting primary health care
researchers at five British universities: Aberdeen,
Bristol, Glasgow, Southampton and Warwick.
The research objective is to identify and describe
changes in the urgent health care workforce and
the impact of these on health systems perfor-
mance, especially in relation to the patient
experience and staff practices. The fact that the
senior collaborators for this programme come
from each of the universities represents a further
strengthening in the relationships of this particular
network, which began to form a decade ago
through initial communications at the level of
reciprocal advisory group memberships and expert
witness contributions. The profile of publications
over this period has reflected this change, moving
from relatively small-scale reports (eg, Moore,
1997) to major collaborative national projects and
findings (eg, Lattimer et al., 2004). The current
study sees the specialist expertise of its different
network members pooled in contributions to a
multi-site case study methodology. For example,
nurse triage and systems design are lead topics for
the Southampton researchers, while the literature
review is led by the Scottish researchers building
on their previous work in this field (Heaney et al.,
2004), and the technological and organisational
changes are assessed by those with relevant
research backgrounds from Warwick (Dale et al.,
2003) and Bristol (Salisbury and Munro, 2003).
All the academic contributors come together
to ensure that there is a common framework for
data capture and analysis, and to share fieldwork
resources.

This growing appreciation of the way in which
networks can operate in research has paved the
way for a more sensitive appreciation of how
the emergent networks in urgent health care are
developing. From an initial survey of 28 Strategic
Health Authorities in England and six Local
Health Boards in Scotland, eight case study
locations were selected for in-depth examination
regarding the scope and scale of their workforce
innovations. Phase 1 of the research included
observation, frontline staff and corporate man-
agement interviews, the conceptual mapping of
patient pathways, documentary analysis and
Local Reference Group meetings and workshops

to explore future scenarios. This phase has now
been completed and Phase 2 is under way. This is
examining the patient experience through ques-
tionnaires and interviews based on a sample
frame that covers six common conditions. Phase 1
has so far highlighted the significant extent to
which the different types of service network affect
the way in which central policies for urgent health
care are implemented, as well as the future
opportunities for incorporating changes in urgent
care within practice-based commissioning.

At this stage, six months prior to the comple-
tion of the final report, a provisional assessment
of the eight case studies separates them into four
network types. In each case the critical decision-
making about urgent health care arrangements
can be traced to a prevailing pattern of largely
lateral relationships across the boundaries of
individual organisational units. The four types
of network may be characterised as essentially
professional, executive, commercial or adminis-
trative. The case study sites are evenly divided
between each type.

In the professional type the prevailing and most
influential network is that of inter-GP relation-
ships. In this model, stable GPs seem to have the
confidence of both the community and commis-
sioners and changes in urgent health care are
being led from conventional surgery settings by
individual GMPs in Primary Care Centres. In
these the doctors themselves, for example, under-
take the bulk of triage functions and strongly
outnumber Emergency Care Practitioners. We
found such professional networks operating in
parts of the South West of England.

The GP/ECP ratio is reversed in one of the case
study sites where the relationships between senior
managers holds sway. In this South of England
executive network, there is a long history of the
corporate leadership from the statutory agencies
exercising comprehensive systems-wide control.
For urgent health care now this is translated into
powerful multi-agency commissioning boards,
and the large-scale call centre developments uti-
lise major capital and technological investment
through a regional ambulance service to cater to
multi-agency health and social care contacts and
referrals. By contrast, the professional network
type relies on systems of data collection over-
whelmingly geared up for the requirements of
General Medical Services.
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The third network is novel and evident in some
outer London areas. Its commercial features stem
from a market orientation that includes both
private sector providers of urgent health care
services with NHS Primary Care Trusts and
clusters of GPs and nursing practice units also
exploring ways of moving to a more autonomous
business format, with at least quasi-independent
sector status. For such a shift there is encourage-
ment from key figures in the network with access
to political and financial goodwill. The principle
of collaborative advantage (Huxham, 1996)
applies to this commercial network type, which
appears to lead to more hybrid and diverse
innovations in urgent health care. These include,
for example, a mixture of specialist on call clinics
and telephone consultation facilities at different
venues with different opening times.

Such a service model is at the opposite end of a
spectrum to the much more standardised version
of urgent health care that is to be found when a
public administrative network prevails. In this
case the most powerful horizontal relationships
are between politicians and officials. This appears
to be the present situation in the new devolved
bureaucracy of Scotland where the large majority
of patient referrals have to pass through NHS24
(the health information service for the people of
Scotland). The contrast with the commercial
network type is illustrated by the different profile
of primary care first contact responses. In the
administrative type there seems to be a restricted
capacity for contributions to urgent health care
from locally sited practitioners, managers, pro-
fessionals and external agencies.

In the final part of the study, Local Reference
Groups will be asked to comment on the emer-
ging characterisations and consider the extent to
which these best describe their own systems. They
will be invited to comment on the systems maps
showing the different patient pathways, from
contact to treatment, associated with the four
types of service model and derived from the data
of the case study sites themselves. The typology
will then also be compared with other data on
emergency and urgent care networks, including
those from parallel research, which has high-
lighted the significance of networks, with distinct
managerial and geographic features, for the
separate commissioning and provider functions
(Turner et al., 2007).

Future implications

An awareness of the alternative types of network
that prevail in urgent health care, and the cultural
context to which each belongs, can help to shape
effectively future policy processes designed to
extend primary health care. A reliance on tradi-
tional models of institutional or incremental
health policy implementation (John, 1998; Meads,
2006) now seems inappropriate because of their
implicit assumption of vertical relationships.
More participative and decentralised approaches
may be more effective in harnessing the energies
contained within the different prevailing patterns
of relationships in urgent health care, and in other
primary care service sectors as well. However, in
looking to promote such approaches through, for
example, practice-based commissioning, a note of
caution must be sounded. So far all the influential
networks identified have been firmly provider-
centred and -directed. Given this self-interest,
there is an important future challenge to be
tackled if the new concept of primary care-based
commissioning for community health improve-
ment is to be converted into a relational reality.
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