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INTRODUCTION:

Ovarian cancer (OC) has the highest mortality rate of all
gynecologic malignancies. Completeness of
cytoreductive surgery is a key prognostic factor for
survival. To differentiate clearly between malignant and
healthy tissue is essential for achieving complete
cytoreduction. Using current approaches, this
differentiation is difficult and can lead to incomplete
tumour removal. OTL38 is a folate analogue conjugated
to a near-infrared fluorescent dye which has high
specificity and affinity for folate receptor alpha (FRα)
expressed in OC. OTL38 together with a specific imaging
system can help the surgeon to visualize diseased
tissue. The objective of this work is to know the
effectiveness and safety of OTL38 in of OC surgery.

METHODS:

Early assessment of OTL38 identified through the early-
awareness and alert-system, “SINTESIS-new
technologies”, of AETS-ISCIII. The searched databases
were: PubMed, WOS, Tripdatabase, Dynamed, Cochrane
Library and ICTRP. Clinical studies using the OTL38 in
cytoreductive surgery in OC published until September
2017 were reviewed.

RESULTS:

Only one publication, supported by industry, was
retrieved. The study assesses the pharmacokinetics and
tolerability of OLT38 in 30 healthy people randomized
into 4 groups with different doses and a control group.
The study also analyses the percentage of cytoreduction
in 12 OC patients. Infusion of 0.025, 0.05, and 0.1 mg/kg
OTL38 doses was associated with mild adverse events
which did not require intervention. The 0.2 mg/kg dose
was associated to adverse events of moderate severity.
In OC patients, 0.0125 mg/kg dose was considered the
optimal dose with mild adverse events. OTL38
accumulated in FRα-positive tumours and metastases
allowed the surgeon to resect an additional 29 percent
of malignant lesions which were not detected using
standard inspection and palpation methods.

CONCLUSIONS:

The OTL38 is an emergent health technology, which
could help in cytoreductive surgery for ovarian cancer.
However, the evidence is scarce and it would be
necessary to continue further studies.
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INTRODUCTION:

It is established that the current cost effectiveness
health technology assessment (HTA) paradigm does not
appropriately value rare disease technologies. Social
willingness-to-pay (SWTP) has been suggested to be
higher for rare disease technologies, it’s inclusion into
existing HTA framework could better reflect social
preferences (SP) and enable a more equitable
evaluation of rare disease technologies. Our study aims
to estimate SP and SWTP for a rare disorder, CLN2
disease.

METHODS:

Relevant attributes for CLN2 disease were developed
and validated by literature review and focus groups with
patient’s primary caregivers. An elicitation survey
(discrete choice experiment (DCE) WTP and relative
social willingness to pay (RS-WTP)) was developed using
the selected attributes and levels of each attribute. The
survey instruments and attributes/levels were tested
and validated in a pre-pilot survey (n= 103) and a
subsequent pilot survey (n= 286) of the United
Kingdom (UK) general population. Information about
CLN2 disease was provided to respondents and their
understanding of the disease was tested including
assessment of framing effects. The main survey with the
general UK population (n= 4,009) is now complete.

RESULTS:

Eight hundred and twenty-six people were contacted, of
which 286 completed the DCE, 113 abandoned the
survey before the DCE and 92 abandoned after the DCE.
There were no significant differences in characteristics
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