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Introduction:Working in intensive care units and in emergencies
is a stressful job. Taking care of acute and serious pathologies may
cause various psychological diseases.
Objectives: This study aimed to screen depression among emer-
gency and intensive care caregivers and to determine factors asso-
ciated with these disorders.
Methods: This is an exhaustive, descriptive and analytical cross-
sectional study that interested paramedical caregivers working in
the emergency and intensive care services from south Tunisia. We
used an anonymous questionnaire that included sociodemo-
graphic, medical and professional characteristics and the subscale
of depression from the Hospital anxiety and depression (HAD)
scale.
Results: A total of 240 patients participated in the survey. The
prevalence of depression was 30.8%. In the univariate study,
depression was associated with the female sex (P=0.006), university
level (p=0.04) and anxiety (p<10-3). Three risk factors of depres-
sion were found in the multivariate analysis: female gender
(OR=2.4 [1.1-7]; P=0.025), and the university school level
(OR=5[1.5-16.7]; P =0.009).
Conclusions: Depressive disorders are common among caregivers
in emergency and intensive care units. This finding highlights the
importance of an early screening of these disorders to improve their
management.
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Introduction:With the increase of older adult population, late life
depression is emerging as a major problem in many countries as it
significantly deteriorates function and quality of life in older adults.
Late life depression is a multidimensional disease that requires
intervention in biopsychosocial perspective. Recent reduction in
family size and rapid simplification of generations are making this
decrease more dramatic. Thus, single older households are becom-
ing general type of household in late life, emphasizing the import-
ance of social engagement in late life depression

Objectives: the purpose of this study is to assess the correlation
between the frequency of face-to-face and non-face-to-face contact
with non-cohabitating adult children and late life depression after
the COVID-19 pandemic. Additionally, we hypothesized 10 pos-
sible moderators and evaluated the moderation effect of each
moderator on the correlation. By identifying groups of older adults
that are more affected by contact with their children, the under-
standing of the relationship between late life depression and family
contact in older adults might provide insights to set intervention
targets in the community.
Methods: Older adults who completed the Living Profiles of Older
People Survey in Korea were included. In total, 7,573 participants
were analyzed bymeasuring their contact frequency and depression
symptoms. Regression analysis was done adjusting covariates. Pro-
cess macro was used to verify the moderating effects of variables.
Results:Multivariable logistic regression analysis showed that both
infrequent face-to-face (OR=1.87, 95% CI=1.56-2.23) and non-
face-to-face contact (OR=1.22, 95% CI=1.03-1.44) with non-
cohabitating adult children group was associated with higher risk
of late life depression compared to a frequent contact group.
Further linear regression analysis, which viewed depressive symp-
toms as SGDS-K score, indicated consistent results in face-to-face
and non-face-to-face contact (estimate=0.468, standard error [SE]
=0.091, p<0.001 and estimate=0.262, standard error [SE]=0.079,
p<0.001, respectively). Finally, using moderation analysis, associ-
ation with late life depression and frequency of face-to-face contact
was moderated by age, quartiles of household income, number of
chronic diseases, frequency of physical activity, existence of spouse,
and nutritional status (NSI) whether effect of frequency of non-
face-to-face contact on late life depression was increased by par-
ticipation in social activity, frequent physical activity, and good
cognitive function (MMSE-DS score)(p for interaction<0.05).
Conclusions: Frequent contact of non-cohabitating children
lowers the risk of later life depression. Several variables were found
significant in moderating contact frequency-depression symptoms.
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Introduction:The risk of suicidemay be elevated in the presence of
personality pathology. Adults with Obsessive Compulsive Person-
ality Disorder (OCPD) may be vulnerable to depression and sui-
cidal thoughts.
Objectives: To identify factors associated with suicide in cases
of OCPD.
Methods: Psychological autopsy procedures were used to gather
detailed information about adults who died by suicide and natural
causes. A total of 75 deceased adults were evaluated using psycho-
logical autopsy procedures. Family members were interviewed
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